PRELIMINARY BID TABULATION

COCHISE COUNTY

PROCUREMENT DEPARTMENT

IFB NO: 14-04-FMD-04
Fleet Vehicles

Opening Date: 7-24-2013

Buyer: Terry Hudson

O'Rielly Chevrolet,

Lawley Motors

Courtesy Chevrolet,

Fairfield Chevrolet,

Spotlight, 1ea

Tucson, AZ Sierra Vista, AZ Phoenix, AZ Fairfield, CA
Bid ltem 1A Tahoe SSV 4WD, White w/LED
spotlight, 1ea $31,158.68 ea $30,816.55 ea $31,175.15ea No Bid
Bid Item 1B Tahoe SSV 4WD, Brown w/o Led
Spotlight, 1ea $30,767.68 ea $30,425.55 ea $30,665.15 ea No Bid
Bid Iltem 2A Tahoe PPV 2WD, White w/iLED
Spotlight, 7ea $28,000.00 ea $27,604.55 ea $27,963.15 ea No Bid
Bid ltem 2B Tahoe PPV 2WD, White wio Led
Spotlight, 1ea $27,525.00 ea $27,213.55 ea $27,453.15 ea No Bid
Bid Item 2C Tahoe PPV 2WD, Brown w/o LED

$27,525.00 ea $27,213.55 ea $27,453.15 ea No Bid




