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Preliminary Bid Tabulation – IFB 15-07-HFP-04 
Aggregate Crushing at County Located Pits 
Due Date: 9/25/2014 at 4:00 p.m. local time 

 
  
Company Name: AGE Contracting Inc. 
 
 
 Bid Item 1: Crushed Aggregate 
 

 
Geographic 

Location 

 
5,000 to 10,000  
tons unit price per 
ton 

 
10,001 to 20,000  
tons unit price per  
ton 

 
20,001 to 30,000 
tons unit price per 
ton 

 
30,001 to 40,000 
tons unit price per 
tons 

 
Sierra Vista – 
Hereford 

 
$5.85 

 
$5.85 

 
$4.97 

 
$4.97 

 
Tombstone 

 
$5.85 

 
$5.85 

 
$4.97 

 
$4.97 

 
Douglas 

 
$6.40 

 
$6.40 

 
$5.52 

 
$5.52 

 
Willcox 

 
$6.00 

 
$6.00 

 
$5.12 

 
$5.12 

 
Elfrida 

 
$6.30 

 
$6.30 

 
$5.42 

 
$5.42 

 
Bowie – San 
Simon 

 
$6.60 

 
$6.60 

 
$5.12 

 
$5.12 

 
Benson 

 
$5.40 

 
$5.40 

 
$4.52 

 
$4.52 

 
Bisbee 

 
$5.85 

 
$5.85 

 
$4.97 

 
$4.97 

 
 
   
 
Bid Item 2: Crushed Concrete without steel 
 

 
Geographic 

Location 

 
5,000 to 10,000  
tons unit price per 
ton 

 
10,001 to 20,000  
tons unit price per  
ton 

 
20,001 to 30,000 
tons unit price per 
ton 

 
30,001 to 40,000 
tons unit price per 
tons 

 
Sierra Vista – 
Hereford 

 
$8.35 

 
$8.35 

 
$8.35 

 
$8.25 

 
Tombstone 

 
$8.35 

 
$8.35 

 
$8.35 

 
$8.25 

 
Douglas 

 
$8.00 

 
$8.00 

 
$8.00 

 
$7.90 

 
Willcox 

 
$8.00 

 
$8.00 

 
$8.00 

 
$8.00 

 
Elfrida 

 
$8.00 

 
$8.00 

 
$8.00 

 
$7.90 

 
Bowie – San 
Simon 

 
$9.00 

 
$9.00 

 
$9.00 

 
$8.90 

 
Benson 

 
$8.00 

 
$8.00 

 
$8.00 

 
$7.90 

 
Bisbee 

 
$8.35 

 
$8.35 

 
$8.35 

 
$8.25 
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Preliminary Bid Tabulation – IFB 15-07-HFP-04 
 
 
Company Name: AGE Contracting Inc. 
   
 
Bid Item 3: Crushed Concrete with Steel 
 

 
Geographic 

Location 

 
5,000 to 10,000  
tons unit price per 
ton 

 
10,001 to 20,000  
tons unit price per  
ton 

 
20,001 to 30,000 
tons unit price per 
ton 

 
30,001 to 40,000 
tons unit price per 
tons 

 
Sierra Vista – 
Hereford 

 
$9.35 

 
$9.35 

 
$9.35 

 
$9.25 

 
Tombstone 

 
$9.35 

 
$9.35 

 
$9.35 

 
$9.25 

 
Douglas 

 
$9.00 

 
$9.00 

 
$9.00 

 
$8.90 

 
Willcox 

 
$9.00 

 
$9.00 

 
$9.00 

 
$8.90 

 
Elfrida 

 
$9.00 

 
$9.00 

 
$9.00 

 
$8.90 

 
Bowie – San 
Simon 

 
$10.00 

 
$10.00 

 
$10.00 

 
$9.90 

 
Benson 

 
$9.00 

 
$9.00 

 
$9.00 

 
$8.90 

 
Bisbee 

 
$9.35 

 
$9.35 

 
$9.35 

 
$9.25 

 

=========================================================================================== 

 

Company Name: Fisher Sand and Gravel 

   
Bid Item 1: Crushed Aggregate 
 

 
Geographic 

Location 

 
5,000 to 10,000  
tons unit price per 
ton 

 
10,001 to 20,000  
tons unit price per  
ton 

 
20,001 to 30,000 
tons unit price per 
ton 

 
30,001 to 40,000 
tons unit price per 
tons 

 
Sierra Vista – 
Hereford 

 
$5.25 

 
$4.75 

 
$4.00 

 
$4.00 

 
Tombstone 

 
$5.25 

 
$4.75 

 
$4.00 

 
$4.00 

 
Douglas 

 
$5.25 

 
$4.75 

 
$4.00 

 
$4.00 

 
Willcox 

 
$5.25 

 
$4.75 

 
$4.00 

 
$4.00 

 
Elfrida 

 
$5.25 

 
$4.75 

 
$4.00 

 
$4.00 

 
Bowie – San 
Simon 

 
$5.25 

 
$4.75 

 
$4.00 

 
$4.00 

 
Benson 

 
$5.25 

 
$4.75 

 
$4.00 

 
$4.00 

 
Bisbee 

 
$5.25 

 
$4.75 

 
$4.00 

 
$4.00 
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Preliminary Bid Tabulation – IFB 15-07-HFP-04 
 
 
Company Name: Fisher Sand and Gravel 
 
 
Bid Item 2: Crushed Concrete without steel 
 

 
Geographic 

Location 

 
5,000 to 10,000  
tons unit price per 
ton 

 
10,001 to 20,000  
tons unit price per  
ton 

 
20,001 to 30,000 
tons unit price per 
ton 

 
30,001 to 40,000 
tons unit price per 
tons 

 
Sierra Vista – 
Hereford 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.20 

 
Tombstone 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.20 

 
Douglas 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.20 

 
Willcox 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.20 

 
Elfrida 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.20 

 
Bowie – San 
Simon 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.20 

 
Benson 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.20 

 
Bisbee 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.20 

 
 
 
  
 Bid Item 3: Crushed Concrete with Steel 
 

 
Geographic 

Location 

 
5,000 to 10,000  
tons unit price per 
ton 

 
10,001 to 20,000  
tons unit price per  
ton 

 
20,001 to 30,000 
tons unit price per 
ton 

 
30,001 to 40,000 
tons unit price per 
tons 

 
Sierra Vista – 
Hereford 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.25 

 
Tombstone 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.25 

 
Douglas 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.25 

 
Willcox 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.25 

 
Elfrida 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.25 

 
Bowie – San 
Simon 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.25 

 
Benson 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.25 

 
Bisbee 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.25 

 
$5.25 

 

 

  
 
 
 



Page 4 of 5 
 

Preliminary Bid Tabulation – IFB 15-07-HFP-04 
 

 

Company Name: Maddux & Sons 
 
 
Bid Item 1: Crushed Aggregate 
 

 
Geographic 

Location 

 
5,000 to 10,000  
tons unit price per 
ton 

 
10,001 to 20,000  
tons unit price per  
ton 

 
20,001 to 30,000 
tons unit price per 
ton 

 
30,001 to 40,000 
tons unit price per 
tons 

 
Sierra Vista – 
Hereford 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
Tombstone 

 
$5.50 

 
$5.50 

 
$5.50 

 
$5.50 

 
Douglas 

 
$4.35 

 
$4.35 

 
$4.35 

 
$4.35 

 
Willcox 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
Elfrida 

 
$5.35 

 
$5.35 

 
$5.35 

 
$5.35 

 
Bowie – San 
Simon 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
Benson 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
Bisbee 

 
$5.35 

 
$5.35 

 
$5.35 

 
$5.35 

 
 
   
 
 
Bid Item 2: Crushed Concrete without steel 
 

 
Geographic 

Location 

 
5,000 to 10,000  
tons unit price per 
ton 

 
10,001 to 20,000  
tons unit price per  
ton 

 
20,001 to 30,000 
tons unit price per 
ton 

 
30,001 to 40,000 
tons unit price per 
tons 

 
Sierra Vista – 
Hereford 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
Tombstone 

 
$6.00 

 
$6.00 

 
$6.00 

 
$6.00 

 
Douglas 

 
$5.50 

 
$5.50 

 
$5.50 

 
$5.50 

 
Willcox 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
Elfrida 

 
$6.35 

 
$6.35 

 
$6.35 

 
$6.35 

 
Bowie – San 
Simon 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
Benson 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
Bisbee 

 
$6.35 

 
$6.35 

 
$6.35 

 
$6.35 
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Preliminary Bid Tabulation – IFB 15-07-HFP-04 
 
 
Company Name: Maddux & Sons 
 
 
  Bid Item 3: Crushed Concrete with Steel 
 

 
Geographic 

Location 

 
5,000 to 10,000  
tons unit price per 
ton 

 
10,001 to 20,000  
tons unit price per  
ton 

 
20,001 to 30,000 
tons unit price per 
ton 

 
30,001 to 40,000 
tons unit price per 
tons 

 
Sierra Vista – 
Hereford 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
Tombstone 

 
$8.50 

 
$8.50 

 
$8.50 

 
$8.50 

 
Douglas 

 
$8.25 

 
$8.25 

 
$8.25 

 
$8.25 

 
Willcox 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
Elfrida 

 
$8.50 

 
$8.50 

 
$8.50 

 
$8.50 

 
Bowie – San 
Simon 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
Benson 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
Bisbee 

 
$8.50 

 
$8.50 

 
$8.50 

 
$8.50 

 
 


